

INDIANA DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION
OFFICIAL TABULATION OF BIDS RECEIVED
FOR THE LETTING OF September 22, 2010

PAGE: 1
DATE: 09/27/10

CONTRACT IB-33023-A
CALL: 131

FED/STATE PROJECT NO. 0902256
DESCRIPTION: DESIGN BUILD, BRIDGE REPLACEMENT
ROUTE: 421
LOCATION: ON US 421 FROM MADISON, IN. TO MILTON, KY
COUNTY: JEFFERSON

ENGINEER'S ESTIMATE: \$ 121,832,000.00 (A + B)
SEYMOUR DISTRICT
DBE GOAL: 3.00

CODE	BIDDER	ADDRESS	PHONE/FAX	AMOUNT OF BID*	TYPE	LOW	REMARKS
	COMPLETION DATE ADJUSTMENT			\$ 3,750,000.00			
	SECTION 0003 ADMINISTRATIVE ITEMS			\$ 6.00			
25-1607500	AMERICAN BRIDGE COMPANY SECTION 0001 9-15-12 OPEN TO TRAFFIC	CORAOPOLIS PA	412-631-1000	\$102,631,906.00	R		A + B = \$111,756,900.00
25-1607500	AMERICAN BRIDGE COMPANY SECTION 0002 5-23-13 OPEN TO TRAFFIC	CORAOPOLIS PA	412-631-1000	NO BID			
35-0799154	TRAYLOR BROS INC SECTION 0001 9-15-12 OPEN TO TRAFFIC	EVANSVILLE IN	812-477-1542	\$114,108,111.00	R		A + B = \$123,233,105.00
35-0799154	TRAYLOR BROS INC SECTION 0002 5-23-13 OPEN TO TRAFFIC	EVANSVILLE IN	812-477-1542	NO BID			
36-2231526	WALSH CONSTRUCTION COMPANY SECTION 0001 9-15-12 OPEN TO TRAFFIC	LAPORTE IN	219-324-4320	\$103,669,833.27	R	X	AWARD DBE 3.05% A + B = \$103,919,927.27
36-2231526	WALSH CONSTRUCTION COMPANY SECTION 0002 5-23-13 OPEN TO TRAFFIC	LAPORTE IN	219-324-4320	NO BID			
44-0341360	MASSMAN CONSTRUCTION CO SECTION 0001 9-15-12 OPEN TO TRAFFIC	KANSAS CITY MO	816-523-1000	NO BID			
44-0341360	MASSMAN CONSTRUCTION CO SECTION 0002 5-23-13 OPEN TO TRAFFIC	KANSAS CITY MO	816-523-1000	\$127,163,957.00	R		A + B = \$136,288,951.00
72-1576467	C J MAHAN CONSTRUCTION CO LLC SECTION 0001 9-15-12 OPEN TO TRAFFIC	GROVE CITY OH	614-875-8200	NO BID			
72-1576467	C J MAHAN CONSTRUCTION CO LLC SECTION 0002 5-23-13 OPEN TO TRAFFIC	GROVE CITY OH	614-875-8200	\$102,379,010.65	R		A + B = \$111,504,004.65

*COLUMN LISTS BIDS FOR PART 'A' ONLY.

NOTE: THE RANK OF THE BIDDERS IS DETERMINED BY COMPARING THE A+B BIDS ON SECTION 0001 MINUS THE COMPLETION DATE ADJUSTMENT, WITH THE A+B BIDS ON SECTION 0002. A BID TOTAL IS THE A+B SUM OF SECTION 0001 OR 0002 PLUS SECTION 0003.